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Congratulations to all our Star Learners this week. We are proud of you all! 

Week ending : Friday 15th November 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Brahms Class Price Class Mozart Class 

Vivaldi Class Zimmer Class Lloyd-Webber Class 

Bernstein Class Dun Class Holst Class 

Elgar Class 

 

Tchaikovsky Class 

Our star learner this week is M. 
She is engaging well in her play 
and is friendly towards the other 
children. She has settled well   
into Nursery. Well done M! 

D is our star learner this week. 
She has shown such a positive 
attitude towards school this 
week and has engaged with all of 
her learning. Well done D! 

Our star learner this week is J 
for always working hard in all of 
his learning, always being kind 
and caring to everyone and     
always smiling. Well done! 

Our star learner this week is S. 
He is always ready, respectful 
and safe in all lessons. He has 
been putting in so much effort 
with his learning and is enthusi-
astic with everything he does. 

Our star learner this week is E 
for marvelous maths. She has 
shown progression and           
conȦdence since she has joined 
Beechwood. 

K is our star learner this week 
for her hard work in writing. K 
comes up with brilliant ideas and 
always produces neat work in 
every lesson. 

S is our star learner this week 
for persevering with her      
learning. She has been sharing 
some brilliant ideas when    
working in a group. Well done S! 

Our star learner this week is M 
for Dun Class for working        
collaboratively with his peers. 
Well done M! 

I is our star learner. He has been 
very absorbed in activities and 
completed all learning tasks this 
week. He has also collaborated 
well with different talk partners. 
Well done! 

Elgar’s star learner this week is 
L. He has shown great progress in 
maths and worked well in a team 
in his PE lessons. 

Our star learner this week is H 
for making excellent progress in 
Maths including long division and 
making big improvements in his 
weekly Arithmetic test. 


